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Diagnostics Advisory Committee Interests Register 
Topic: Algorithm-based remote monitoring of heart failure risk data in people with cardiac implantable electronic devices 
NICE’s declaration of interest policy can be accessed here  
 

Name Role with NICE Type of 
interest 

Description of interest Interest 
arose 

Interest 
declared 

Interest  
ceased 

Comments 

Brian Shine Standing committee 
member 

None - - - -  

Alex Novak Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

Anne Scott Standing committee 

member 
Financial 
Interest 

Speaker Fees, Abbott Vascular: 

Paravalvular Leak Closure 

Masterclass 

November 

2022 

April 2024 November 
2022 

Declare & 
participate 

Anne Scott Standing committee 

member 
Non-financial 
professional and 
personal interest 

Intraprocedural Imager for Reshape-

HF trial at Edinburgh Heart Centre 

2018 Current 

although no 

patients 

recruited 

since 2020 

and none 

anticipated 

2020 Declare and 
participate 

Diane Davies Standing committee 

member 

None - - - -  

Farai Goromonzi Standing committee 

member 
Financial I was an employee of Medtronic until 

July 2023 
- April 2024 July 2023 Complete 

exclusion 

Confirmed by 
AD and Chair 
16/04/24 

https://www.nice.org.uk/Media/Default/About/Who-we-are/Policies-and-procedures/Declaring-managing-interests-for-advisory-committees.docx
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Ghada Ahmed Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

John Cairns 

 
 

Standing committee 

member 
Financial Advisory board for SOBI for a 

treatment of diffuse large B-cell 
lymphoma 

January 
2023 

January 
2023 

Ongoing Declare and 
participate. 

John Cairns 

 

Standing committee 

member 
Financial 

Advice to SOBI regarding economic 
evaluation of efanesoctocog alfa for 
treating haemophilia A. 

May 2023 April 2024 July 2023 
 

Declare and 
participate 

John Cairns Standing committee 

member 
Financial 

Participate in steering group for study 
of preferences for pain relief funded by 
Grünenthal. 

April 2023 

 

April 2024 February 
2024 

Declare and 
participate 

John Cairns Standing committee 

member 
Financial 

Participation in meeting advising on 
economic modelling of treatments for 
Dravet Syndrome and Lennox Gastaut 
Syndrome. Participants were not 
advised of the company or product. 

February 
2024 

 

April 2024 March 2024 Declare and 
participate 

Jonathan Weir-
McCall  

Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

Joy Allen Standing committee 

member 
Non-financial 
professional and 
personal interest 

 

I am an employee of Roche 
Diagnostics.  

Roche Diagnostics manufacture NT-
proBNP to aid in the diagnosis of 
Heart Failure and I am actively 
involved in multiple projects 
supporting diagnostic pathway 
evidence development for chronic and 
acute heart failure diagnosis and 
management around up titration of 
guideline directed medical therapy in 
newly diagnosed patients with acute 
Heart Failure (Mebazaa 2022). NT-
proBNP may be used for diagnosis 
prior to CIED treatment or post 

31 August 
2021 

March 2024 Ongoing Complete 
exclusion 

Confirmed by 
AD and Chair 
2 April 2024 



     
 

Diagnostics advisory committee – interests register       3 of 4 

treatment, as well as monitoring in 
reviews of patients whose condition is 
stable. NT-proBNP could not be a 
direct competitor [to the techs being 
evaluated], it could just be used in 
multiple points in the pathway for 
these patients, i.e. diagnosis of HF 
and potentially for monitoring. 

Keith Abrams Standing committee 

member 
Financial 

I am a director of a consultancy 
company, which has provided 
consultancy services to Boston 
Scientific Ltd. This consultancy is 
related to the technologies under 
evaluation. I have not been involved in 
the services provided to Boston 
Scientific. 

September 
2023 

March 2024 Ongoing Complete 
exclusion 

Confirmed by 
AD and Chair 
15 April 2024 

Keith Abrams Standing committee 

member 
Financial Provided methodological consultancy 

advice to Medtronic, and was paid 

directly by the company. 

July 2022 April 2024 July 2022 Complete 

exclusion 

Confirmed by 

AD and Chair 

15 April 2024 

Matt Stevenson 

 

Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

Michael Morton Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

Neil Hawkins Standing committee 

member 
Financial A consultancy company I am a 

director of has provided consultancy 
services to Boston Scientific ltd. I had 
no involvement in the services 
provided to Boston Scientific. The 
consultancy work is related to the 
technologies under evaluation. 

September 
2023 

March 2024 Ongoing Complete 
exclusion 

Confirmed by 
AD and Chair 
2 April 2024 
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Neil Hawkins Standing committee 

member 
Financial A consultancy company I am a 

director of has provided consultancy 
services to Abbot Rapid Diagnostics 
ltd. It was not related to the 
technologies under evaluation. 

July 2023 March 2024 December 
2023 

Complete 
exclusion 

Confirmed by 
AD and Chair 
2 April 2024 

Patrick McGinley Standing committee 

member 
Financial Hon Treasurer Association for Study 

of Obesity   
October 
2020 

November 
2023 

Ongoing Declare and 
participate. 

Patrick McGinley Standing committee 

member 
Non-financial 
professional and 
personal interest 

Member of the strategic committee of 
APPG on Obesity 

November 
2019 

March 2024 Ongoing Declare and 
participate. 

Patrick McGinley Standing committee 

member 
Non-financial 
professional and 
personal interest 

Faculty member of MTech Access 
providing advice on NHS finance 
structure, pricing and tariff 
developments   

Jan 2019 March 2024 Ongoing Declare and 
participate 

Radha 
Ramachandran  

Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

Rashmi Kumar Standing committee lay 
member 

None - - - -  

Rebecca Allcock Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

Sam Creavin 

 

Standing committee 

member 
None - - - -  

 

 
 
 
 


